
 

 
 

 
 

 

 

1. Academic and Administrative Activities 

 

Implementation of Supplementary Examinations:  -
Supplementary exams were completed for 

previous students who failed some courses in 
semesters. 

 

Preparation and Approval of Summer Semester  -
2025 Schedules: Schedules were prepared in 

Riyashi, Chairman -coordination with Dr. Saleh Al
of the Schedules Committee. 

 

Division of Courses and Determining Their  -
were organized and lecture times Timings: Courses 

were set to achieve a balance between theoretical 
and practical aspects. 

 

Creation of Subject Groups: Study groups were  -
created for each course, where academic content 
was published and students and faculty members 

 ddedwere a 

 

 



 

 

 

 
 

2. Academic Achievements 

 

Awarding a PhD: Researcher Dr. Mounir Abdel  -
Bari Abdel Fattah Abdo was awarded a PhD after 
defending his dissertation entitled "Protecting 
Information Systems Networks from 
Cyberattacks." 

 

3. Academic Workshops 

 

"Basics of Scientific Research: From Idea to  -
Publication" workshop, presented by Dr. Mohamed 
Rashidi. 

 

"How to Prepare a Comprehensive Research  -
Malik.-Plan" workshop, presented by Dr.  Yasser Al 

 

4. Joining New Academic Talents 

 

Assistant  –an Wahba Dr. Hossam Fathy Suleim -
Department of Networks and  –Professor 

Cybersecurity. 

 

 –Din Mohamed Hussein -Dr. Duaa Mohi El -
Department of Networks and  –Assistant Professor 

Cybersecurity 
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5. Activities and Events 

 

Activities, and Events: Posting Congratulations,  -
ted by The college's achievements were celebra

posting congratulatory messages on the occasion 
of the award of doctoral degrees and the joining of 
new faculty members. 

 

Finally, these achievements reflect the continuous 
f the College of Computer Science development o

and Information Technology, as the college strives 
to achieve academic and administrative excellence 
by promoting scientific research, developing the 
educational process, attracting academic talent, 

academic environment.  and fostering an active
These achievements underscore the college's 
commitment to excellence and innovation, 
contributing to strengthening its position as a 
leading academic institution in the field of 
computer science and information technology. 
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